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Also paragraph (a) of § 61.357 is being
modified to clarify the objectives and to
clarify w. at information is required in
the initial'report. Many inquiries have
been received regarding the required
accuracy o the waste qulantity and
concentration estimates, the possibility
of amending the initial report, and the
need for inclusion of a description of the
controls to be installed and a
compliance schedule. Because EPA
specifically provided up to 2 years for
compliance with the control
requirements of the standard, the
purpose of the initial report is to identify
facilities subject to the control
requirements, to identify which streams
must be controlled, and to provide the
basis for exemption of streams. The
initial report should represent the
owner's or operator's best estimate of
the waste stream characteristics based
on existing information and current
configuration and operating conditions.
This report may then be updated as new
information becomes available or as
conditions change. Consequently, a new
paragraph (4) is being added to § 61.357
[a) to clarify what information is
required in the initial report. This
change does not alter the control.
requirements or the reporting
requirements. Paragraph (b) of § 61.357
is being corrected to require that
facilities with less than 1 megagram/ -

year benzene waste file updated reports
when the waste quantity increases to 1
megagram/year or more. This correction
is consistent with the intent to require
annual reporting for all facilities with 1
to 10 megagrams/year of benzene waste.

Finally, EPA would like to note that
owners and operators of facilities
subject to NESHAP should consult the
general provisions (subpart A) of part 61
whenever there are questions regarding
the applicability or the implementation
of a standard. In this section, general
requirements regarding source reporting,
waivers, and emission testing are
presented. Section 61.04 requires that all
communications, including all requests,
reports, and applications, be submitted
in duplicate to the appropriate Regional
Office of EPA and to the State agency, if
the authority to implement the' standard
has been delegated. Section 61.04
provides a list of addresses for the
Regional Offices and for State agencies
that have been delegated authority to
enforce NESHAP.

Dated: August 27, 1990.
Michael Shapiro,
Acting Assistant Administ rtor for Air and
Radiation.

The following corrections are being
made in FRL 3706-1;.National Emission
Standards for Hazardous Air Pollutants;

Benzene Emissions from Chemical
Manufacturing Process Vents. Industrial
Solvent Use, Benzene Waste,
Operations, Benzene Transfer
Operations, and Gasoline Marketing
System published in the Federal Register
on March 7, 1990 (55 FR 8292).

1. Paragraph (b) of § 61.340 on page
8346, column 3, is revised to read as
follows:

§ 61.340 Applicability.

(b) The provisions of this subpart
apply to owners and operators of
hazardous waste treatment, storage, and
disposal facilities that treat, store, or
dispose of hazardous waste generated
by any facility listed in paragraph (a) of
this section. The waste streams at
hazardous waste treatment, storage, and
disposal facilities subject to the
provisions of this subpart are the
benzene-containing hazardous waste
from any facility listed in paragraph (a)
of this section. A hazardous waste
treatment, storage, and disposal facility
is a facility that must obtain a
hazardous waste management permit
under Subtitle C of the Solid Waste
Disposal Act.

§ 61.346- [Corrected]

2. In paragraph (b)(2)(ii)(A) of § 61.346
on page 8350, column 2, line 6, remove
"includes use of water seal controls."
and add "includes use of water seal
controls on the junction box."

§ 61.348 [Corrected]

3. In paragraph (b)(2)(ii)(B) of § 61.348
on page 8351, Column 2, revise the last
sentence to read "A unit shall be
considered enhanced biodegradation if
it is a suspended-growth process that
generates biomass, uses recycled
biomass, and periodically removes
biomass from the process. An enhanced
biodegradation unit typically operates at
a food-to-microorganism ratio in the
range of 0.05 to 1.0 kg of biological
oxygen demand per kg of biomass per
day, a mixed liquor suspended solids
ratio in the range of 1 to 8 grams per
liter, and a residence time in the range
of 3 to 36 hours."

§ 61.349 [Corrected]
4. In paragraph (a)(2)(i)(B) of § 61.349

on page 8352. column 1, in line 2. remove
"concentration of 20 ppmv" and add
"concentration of 20 ppmv (as
compound by Method 18)".

§ 61.351 [Corrected]
5. In paragraph (a)(2) of § 61.351 on

page 8352, column 3, line 2. remove "40

CFR 60.112(a)(2)" and add "40 CFR
60.112b(a](2)."'

§ 61.355 [Corrected]
6. In paragraph (a)(1) of § 61.355 on

page 8353, column 3,,in line 4 remove
"than 10 percent water," and add "than
10 percent water, on a volume basis as
total water,".

7. In § 61.357 on page 8360, column 1,
is amended by adding paragraph (a)(4)
as follows:

§ 61.357 Reporting requirements.
(a) * *
(4) This information should present

the owner's or operator's best estimate
of the waste stream characteristics
based on existing information and
current configuration and operating
conditions. An owner or operator only
needs to list in the report those waste
streams that contact materials
containing benzene. The report does not
need to include a description of the
controls to be installed to comply with
the standard or other information
required in § 61.10(b) of this part. The
owner or operator should update and
resubmit the report to the Administrator
when new information becomes
available. Instances where resubmittal
of the report would be appropriate
include cases where results from
surveys of waste stream characteristics
become available after June 5, 1990, and
cases where the process is redesigned
such that the facility waste
characteristics could be changed before
the March 7, 1992, compliance date.

§ 61.357 [Corrected)
8. In paragraph (b) of § 61.357, on page,

8360, column 1, line 26, remove "10 Mg/
yr" and add "1 Mg/yr."

[FR Doc. 90-20978 Filed 9-7-90; 8:45 amj
BILLING CODE 660-50--M

40 CFR Part 228

[FRL-3828-81

Ocean Dumping; Designation of a Site
Located Offshore of Port Mansfield,
TX

AGENCY: Environmental Protection
Agency (EPA).
ACTION: Final rule.

SUMMARY: EPA today designates a
dredged material disposal site located in
the Gulf of Mexico offshore of Port-
Mansfield. Texas for the continued
disposal of dredged material removed
from the Port Mansfield Entrance
Channel. This action is necessary to
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provide an acceptable ocean dumping .

site for the current and future disposal
of this material. This final site
designation is for an indefinite period of
time. The site is subject to monitoring to
insure that unacceptable adverse
environmental impacts do not occur.
DATES: This designation shall become
effective Qctober 10, 1990.
ADDRESSES: Norm Thomas, Chief,
Federal Activities Branch (6E-F), U.S.
EPA, 1445 Ross Avenue, Dallas, Texas
75202-2733.

The file supporting this designation
and the letters of comment are available
for public inspection at the following
locations:
EPA, Region 6, 1445 Ross Avenue, 9th

Floor, Dallas, Texas 75202 ,

Corps of Engineers, Galveston District,
444 Barracuda Avenue, Galveston,
Texas 77550.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT.
Norm Thomas 214/655-2260 or FTS/255-
2260.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION:

A. Background

Section 102(c) of the Marine
Protection, Research, and Sanctuaries
Act of 1972, as amended, 33 U.S.C. 1401
et seq. ("the Act"), gives the
Administrator of EPA the authority to
designate sites where ocean dumping
may be permitted. On December 23,
1986, .the Administrator delegated the
authority to designate ocean dumping
sites to the Regional Administrator of
the Region in which the site is located.
This site designation is being made
pursuant to that authority.

The EPA Ocean Dumping Regulations
(40 CFR chapter I, subchapter H, section
228.4) state that ocean dumping sites
will be designated by publication in part
228. A list of "Approved Interim and
Final Ocean Dumping Sites"was
published on January 11, 1977 (42 FR
2461 et seq.). That list established a site
off Port Mansfield, Texas as an interim
site for the disposal of material dredged
from the entrance channel. In January
1980, the interim status of the site was
extended indefinitely.

B. EIS Development

Section 102(2)(c) of the National'
Environmental Policy Act of 1969, 42
U.S.C. 4321 et seq., ("NEPA") requires
that Federal' agencies prepare
, EnvironmentalImpact Statements (EISs)
on proposals for major Federal actions
significantly affecting the quality of the
human environment. While NEPA does
not apply to EPA activities of this type,
EPA has voluntarily committed to
prepare EISs in connection with.ocean

dumping site designations such as this
(39 FR 16186, May 7, 1974).

EPA has prepared a Final
Environmental Impact Statement
entitled "Environmental Impact
Statement (EIS) for the Port Mansfield
Ocean Dredged Material Disposal Site
Designation." On July 13, 1990, a notice
of availability of the Final EIS for public
review and comment was published in
the Federal Register. The public
comment period on this Final EIS closed
on August 13, 1990. No comment letters
were received.

In accordance with the requirements
of section 7 of the Endangered Species
Act, EPA has prepared a biological
assessment concerning the impact of
site designation on endangered and
threatened species that may be present
in the project area. EPA has determined
that no adverse effect will result and
has provided its determination and
assessment to the National Marine
Fisheries Service (NMFS). By letter
dated August 17, 1990, NMFS concurred
with EPA's determination of no adverse
effect.

The action discussed in the EIS is
designation for continuing use of an
ocean disposal site for dredged material.
The purpose of the designation is to
provide an environmentally acceptable
location for ocean disposal. The
appropriateness of ocean disposal is
determined on a case-by-case basis.

The EIS discussed the need for the
action and examined ocean disposal
sites and alternatives to the proposed
action. Land based disposal alternatives
were examined in a previously
published EIS prepared by. the Corps of
Engineers and the analysiswas updated
in this Final EIS. The COE concluded
that there was no nearby land area
suitable for use as a disposal site and
that the costs of transport to any
suitable upland area were
uneconomical. This would require the
acquisition of new areas. Since the
surrounding land areas are wetlands or
shallow bay habitats, development and
use of a suitable sized replacement area
would result in a significant loss of
quality wetlands or bay bottoms. A
land-based alternative would offer no
environmental benefit to ocean dispdsaL.

Four ocean disposal alternatives-two
nearshore sites (i.e., the interim-
designated site and the proposed site), a,
mid-shelf site and a deepwater site-
were evaluated. Both the mid-shelf and
deepwater sites were'eliminated due to
limited feasibility for monitoring,
increased transportation costs and
increased safety risks. In addition the
material to be dredged is of a different
sediment type than that found fiurther
offshore, which could impact the

biological community composition at
these areas.

Portions of the interim-designated site
are within the' jetty buffer zone and the
beach buffer zone. Therefore, the
interim-designated site is notbeing
designated. The new disposal site was
selected to comply with areas of
biological sensitivity and the beach and
jetty buffer zones and to keep the
disposal site inthe nearshore sand
habitat, as close to the channel as
possible.,

This final rulemaking notice fills the
same role as the Record of Decision
required under regulations promulgated
by the Council on Environmental
Quality for agencies subject to NEPA.

C. Site Designation

On August 7, 1989, at (54 FR 32354)
EPA proposed designation of this site
for the continuing disposal of dredged
materials from the Port Mansfield .
Entrance Channel. The public comment
period on this proposed action closed on
September 21, 1989. One comment letter
was received from the Department of
the Interior (DOI). DOI expressed
concern about the dredged material
being transported to and ultimately
deposited -within the boundaries of the
Padre Island National Seashore or the
Mansfield Cut Underwater
Archeological District. DOI
recommended that the monitoring plan
include confirmation of sediment
movement and offered assistance in
development of this facet of the plan.
EPA will contact the Superintendent of
the Padre Island National Seashore
during development of the monitoring
plan.

The site is located approximately 1.1
miles from the coast at its closest point.
The water depth at the site ranges from
35 to 50 feet. The coordinates of the
rectangular-shaped site are as follows:
26°34'24' N., 97'15'15' W.; 26°34'26' N.,
97o14'17 . W.; 26°33'57' N., 97o14'17' W.;
26-33'557 N., 97-15'15' W. If at any time
disposal operations at the site. cause
unacceptable adverse impacts, further
use of the site will be restricted or
terminated.

D. Regulatory Requirements

Five-general criteria are used in the
selection and approval of ocean
disposal sites for continuing use'. Sites
are selected so as to minimize
interference with other marine activities,
to keep any temporary perturbations'
from the dumping from causing impacts
outside the disposal site, and to permit
effective nibnitoring to detect any
adverse impacts at a n early stage .
Where feasible, locations off the
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Continental Shelf are chosen. If at any
time disposal operations at an interim
site cause unacceptable adverse
impacts, the use of that site will be
terminated as soon as alternate disposal
sites can be designated. The general
criteria are given in,§ 228.5 of the EPA
Ocean Dumping Regulations; § 228.6
lists eleven specific factors used in
evaluating a disposal site to assure that
the general criteria are met.

The site, as discussed below under the
eleven specific factors, is acceptable
under the five general criteria. EPA has
determined, based on the information.
presented in the Final EIS, that a site off
the Continental Shelf is not feasible due
to monitoring difficulties, increased
transportation costs and greater safety
risks. No environmental benefit would
be obtained by selecting such a site. The
characteristics of the selected site are
reviewed below in terms of the eleven
factors.

1. Geographical Position, Depth of
Water, Bottom Topography and
Distance From Coast (40 CFR
228.6(a)(1))

Geographical position, average water
depth, and distance from the coast for
the disposal site are given above..
Bottom topography is flat with no
unique features or relief.

2. Location in Relation to Breeding,
Spawning, Nursery, Feeding, or Passage
Areas of Living Resources in Adult or
Juvenile Phases (40 CFR 228.6(a)(2))

Breeding, spawning, nursery, feeding,
and passage areas in the project area
were identified during the siting
feasibility process and eliminated from
consideration. There is an area of
snapper banks and sports fishing which
is excluded, including a one-mile buffer
zone. The jetties, including a one-mile
buffer zone, are excluded as a fishing
area and as a migratory pathway. Also
excluded were lighted platforms and
non-submerged shipwrecks which
improve fishing.

3. Location in Relation to Beaches and
Other Amenity Areas (40 CFR
228.6(a)(3))

The site is located more than 0.8 mile
from any beach or other amenity area.

4. Types and Quantities of Wastes
Proposed To Be Disposed of, and
Proposed Methods of Release, Including
Methods of Packing the Wastes; If Any
(40 CFR sec. 228.6(a)(4))

Only maintenance material from the
Port Mansfield Entrance Channel will be
disposed. Historically, an average of
170,000 cy/yr has been dredged from the
channel t roughly 15-month intervals.
This material has historically been
transported byhopper dredges but could
be transported by pipeline. Based on.
chemicalafiaylses and biological

toxicity studies of past maintenance
material, it was concluded that no
special location or precautions would be
necessary for the disposal of the
dredged materials.

5. Feasibility of Surveillance and
Monitoring (40 CFR 228.6(a)(5))

The site is amenable to surveillance
and monitoring. A monitoring and
surveillance program, consisting of
water, sediment and elutriate chemistry;
bioassays; bioaccumulation studies; and
benthic infaunal analyses, is proposed
for the Port Mansfield site.

6. Dispersal, Horizontal Transport
and Vertical Mixing Characteristics of
the Area, Including Prevailing Current
Direction and Velocity, If Any (40 CFR
228.6(a)(6))

Physical oceanographic parameters
including dispersal, horizontal transport
and vertical mixing characteristics were
used: (1) to develop the necessary buffer
zones for the siting feasibility analysis,
and (2) to determine the minimum size
of the site. Predominant longshore
currents, and thus predominant
longshore transport, is to the north.
Long-term mounding has not historically
occurred. Therefore, steady longshore
transport and occasional storms,
including hurricanes, remove the
disposed material from the site.

7. Existence and Effects of Current
and Previous Discharges and Dumping
in the Area (Including Cumulative
Effects) (40 CFR 2289.6(a)(7))

Based on the results of chemical and
bioassay testing of past maintenance
material and material from the existing
disposal site plus chemical analyses of
water from the area, there are no
indications of water or sediment quality
problems. Testing of past maintenance
material indicated that it was
acceptable for ocean disposal under 40
CFR part 227. Studies of the benthos at
the interim-designated site and nearby

-areas have not indicated any significant
decrease or change in composition of
the benthos at the disposal site.

8. Interference With Shipping,
Fishing, Recreation, Mineral Extraction,
Desalination, Fish and Shellfish Culture,
Areas of Special Scientific Importance
and Other Legitimate Uses of the Ocean
(40 CFR 228.6(a)(8))
• -Impacts to shipping, ineral extraction,
commercial and recreational fishing,
recreational areas and historic sites
*have been evaluated for the Port
Mansfield site designation. Use of the
sitel should not interfere with these and
other legitimate uses of the ocean
because the siting feasibility process
was designed to reduce the possibility of
a site which would interfere. Disposal'
operations in the past have not
interfered with other usbs.

9. The Existing Water Quality and
Ecology of the Site as Determined by
Available Data or by Trend Assessment
or Baseline Surveys (40 CFR 228.6(a)(9))

Monitoring studies have shown only
short-term water-column perturbations
of turbidity, and perhaps increased
chemical oxygen demand (COD), which
resulted from disposal operations. No
short-term sediment quality perturbation
has been directly related to disposal
operations. In general, the water and
sediment quality is good throughout the
disposal area and there have been no
long-term adverse impacts on water and
sediment quality from disposal
operations. In addition there has been
no long-term impacts on the benthos at
the interim-designated site.

10. Potentiality for the Development
or Recruitment of Nuisance Species in
the Disposal Site (40 CFR 228.6(a)(10))

With disturbance to any benthic
community, initial recolonizationwill be
by opportunistic species. However,
these species are not nuisance species in
the sense that they would interfere with
other legitimate uses of the ocean or that
they are human pathogens. Continued
disposal of maintenance material at the
site should not attract nor promote the
development or recruitment of nuisance
species.

11. Existence At or In Close Proximity
to the Site of-Any Significant Natural or
Cultural Featdres of Historical
Importance (40 CFR 228.6(a)(11))

Areas and features of historical
importance were evaluated during the
siting feasibility process. The nearest
site of historical importance is located
near the jetties, approximately 0.85
miles from .the closest edge of the
disposal site. Use of the site would not
impact any known historical or cultural
sites.

E. Action

The EIS concludes that the site may
appropriately be designated for use. The
site is compatible with the five general
criteria and eleven specific factors used
for site evaluation. The designation of
the Port Mansfield site as an EPA
approved ocean dumping site is being
published as final rulemaking.

It should be emphasized that, if an
ocean dumping site is designated, such a
site designation does not constitute or
imply EPA's approval of actual disposal
of materials at sea'. Before ocean
dumping of dredged material at the site
may occur, the Corps of Engineers must
evaluate a permit application according'
to EPA's ocean dumping criteria. EPA
has the authority to approve or to,
disapprove or to piopose conditions
upon dredged material-permits for ocean
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dumping. While the Corps does not
administratively issue itself a permit, th(
requirements that must be met before
dredged material derived from Federal
projects can be discharged into ocean
waters are the same as where a permit
would be required.

F. Regulatory Assessments

-Under the Regulatory Flexibility Act,
EPA is required to perform a Regulatory
Flexibility Analysis for all rules which
may have a significant impact on a
substantial number of small entities.
EPA has determined that this action will
not have a significant impact on small
entities since the site designation will
only have the effect of providing a
disposal option for dredge material.
Consequently, this rule does not
necessitate preparation of a Regulatory
Flexibility Analysis.

Under Executive Order 12291, EPA
must judge whether a regulation is
"major" and therefore subject to the
requirement of a Regulatory Impact
Analysis. This action will not result in
an annual effect on the economy of $100
million or more or cause any of the other
effects which would result in its being
classified by the Executive Order as a
."major" rule. Consequently, this rule
'does not necessitate preparation of a
Regulatory Impact Analysis.

This Final Rule does not contain any
information collection requirements
subject to the Office of Management and
Budget review under the Paperwork
Reduction Act of 1980,44 U.S.C. 3501 et
seq.

List of Subjects in 40 CFR Part 228

Water pollution control.

Dated: August 27.1990.
Robert E. Layton Jr., P.E.,
RegionalAdministrotor ofRegion 6.

In consideration of the foregoing.
subchapter H of chapter I of title 40 is
amended as set forth below.

PART 228--[AMENDED]

1. The authority citation for part 228
continues to read as follows:

Authority: 33 U.S.C. Sections 1412 and 1418.

2. Section 228.12 is amended by
removing from paragraph (a)(3) under

. "Dredged Material Sites" the entry for
Port Mansfield Channel and adding
paragraph (b)(80) to read as follows:

§ 22i.i2 Deegation of management
authority for Interim ocean dumping sites.

(b),
(80) Port.Mansfield, Texas-Region 6.

Location: 26°34'24"N., 97°15'15" W.; 26°34'2O"
N.. 97'14'17" W.; 26°33'57" N., 97'14'17"
W.; 26'33'55" N., 97°15'15" W.

Size: 0.42 square nautical miles.
Depth: Ranges from 35-50 feet.
Primary Use: Dredged material.
Period of Use: Indefinite period of time.
Restriction: Disposal shall be limited to

dredged material from the Port Mansfield
Entrance Channel, Texas.

* * * * *

(FR Doc. 90-21163 Filed 9-740. &45 am]
BILLING CODE eS6o-6"0-

40 CFR Part 228

[FRL 3828-7]

Ocean Dumping: Designation of a Site
Located Offshore of Port O'Connor,
TX

AGENCY: Environmental Protection
Agency (EPA).
ACTION: Final rule.

SUMMARY: EPA today designates a
dredged material disposal site locatedin
the Gulf of Mexico offshore of Port
O'Connor, Texas for the continued
disposal of dredged material removed
from the Matagorda Ship Channel. This
action is necessary to provide an
acceptable ocean dumping site for the
current and future disposalof this
material. This final site designation is
for an indefinite period of time. The site
is subject to monitoring to insure that
unacceptable adverse environmental
impacts do not occur.
EFFECTIVE DATE: This designation shall
become effective October 10. 1990.
ADDRESSES: Norm Thomas, Chief,
Federal Activities Branch (613-F), U.S.
EPA, 1445 Ross Avenue, Dallas, TX
75202-2733.

The file supporting this designation
and the letters of comment are available
for public inspection at the following
locations: EPA. Region 6, 1445 Ross
Avenue, Ninth Floor, Dallas, Texas
75202.
Corps of Engineers, Galveston District,

444'Barracuda Avenue, Galveston,
Texas 77550.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:.
Norm Thomas, 214/655-2280 or FTS/
255-2260.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION.

A. Background

Section 102(c) of the Marine
Protection, Research, and Sanctuaries
Act of 1972, as amended; 33 U.S.C. 1401
et seq. ("the Act"), gives the
Administrator of EPA the authority to
designate sites where ocean dumping
-may be permitted. On Decemnber23,

1986, the Administrator delegated the
authority to designate ocean dumping
sites to the Regional Administrator of
the Region in which the site is located.
This site designation is being made
pursuant to that authority.

The EPA Ocean Dumping Regulations
(40 CFR chapter 1. subchapter H, § 228.4)
state that ocean dumping sites will be
designated by publication in part 228. A
list of "Approved Interim and Final
Ocean Dumping Sites" was published on
January 11, 1977 (42 FR 2481 et seq.).
That list established the Matagorda Ship
Channel site as an interim site for the
disposal of material dredged from the
entrance channel. In January 1980, the
interim status of the site was 'extended
indefinitely.

B. EIS Development

Section 102(2)(c) of the National
Environmental Policy Act of 1969,42
U.S.C. 4321 et seq., ("NEPA"), requires
that Federal agencies prepare
Environmental Impact Statements (EISs)
on proposals for major Federal actions
significantly affecting the quality of the
human environment. While NEPA does
not apply to EPA activities of this type,
EPA has voluntarily committed to
prepare EISs in connection with ocean
dumping site designations such as this
(39 FR 16186, May 7,1974).

EPA has prepared a Final
Environmental Impact Statement
entitled "Environmental Impact
Statement (EIS) for the Matagorda Ship
Channel Ocean Dredged Material
Disposal'Site'Designation." On July 13;
1990, a notice of availability of the Final
EIS for public review and comment was
published in the Federal Register. The
public comment period on this Final EIS
closed on August 13, 1990. No comment
letters were received.

In accordance with the requirements
of section 7 of the Endangered Species
Act, EPA has prepared a biological
assessment concerning the impact of
site designation on endangered and
threatened species that may be present
in the project area. EPA has determined
that no adverse effect will result and
has provided its determination and
assessment to the National Marine.,
Fisheries Service (NMFS). By letter
dated August 17, 1990, NMFS concurred
with EPA's determination of no effect.

The action discussed in the EIS is
designation for continuing use of an
ocean disposal site for dredged material.
The purpose of the designation is to
provide an environmentally acceptable
location for ocean disposal. The
appropriateness of ocean disposal is
determined on a case-by-case basis. The
EIS discussed the need for the action




